



Request for Waiver of Bid Procurement

Name	Greg Petersen	Department	Highway
Email	Petersen.greg@countyofdane.com	Date	4/4/2018
Phone	608-266-9081	Purchasing Agent	Pete Patten

Vendor	Michels Corporation			Vendor MUNIS #	4696
Req #	TBD	Year	2018	Total Cost	Approx. \$104,286
Vendor Quote Attached To This Waiver:					<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes

Provide a detailed description of the goods/services intended to be purchased:

The material being requested for waiver is a 3/8" Pea Gravel or Granite Chip required as a cover material in the sealcoat process.



Request for Waiver of Bid Procurement

Procurement Exception List	
<input type="checkbox"/>	Emergency Procurement
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Only one vendor possesses the unique and singularly available ability to meet the Department's requirements
<input type="checkbox"/>	Unique and specific technical qualifications are required
<input type="checkbox"/>	A special adaptation for a special purpose is required
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	A unique or opportune buying condition exists

Provide a detailed explanation as to why the competitive bidding (RFB/RFP) process cannot be used. Also provide a detailed justification in relation to the Procurement Exception chosen:
<p>Dane County Purchasing has issued the 2018 Aggregate for Surface Treatment bid twice. Both bids did not produce a vendor capable of providing all necessary materials at a cost within budget and within needed constraints for trucking.</p> <p>During the construction season the Highway Department needs to balance trucking requirements between projects. Sealcoat project occurs during the middle of the construction season so trucks must be shared between projects. The following general rules are applied to trucking to keep all operations running efficiently.</p> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> Limit County Haul distance to 10 miles or less When necessary and on a limited basis increase haul distance to 10-20 miles Projects requiring hauling over 20 miles should be limited in scope so that all work can be accomplished in a single day. <p>The bid proposals received would require County trucking distances between 28 to 55 miles.</p> <p>Michels Corporation was contacted to provide pricing outside of the bid process. Attached to this waiver is an analysis of the estimated cost totals incorporating County trucking costs. By utilizing Michels Corporation, Dane County would save over \$50,000 and be within budget and limit County Trucking distance to 0-7 miles.</p>

Bid Waiver Approval (Purchasing Use Only)

Under \$35,000 – Controller Approval	Date
Over \$35,000 – Personnel & Finance Committee Approval	Date

2018 Sealcoat Bid Tally

Bid #118040 Agregate for Surface Treatment

Opened: March 30, 2018

DNR Parking Lot @ Intersection of CTH A & CTH G

\$ 1.00 /ton Stockpile

0.28 Hauling/ton/mile

CTH A (West Count Line to STH 78)

OPTION "A"

OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE

	Ton	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	320	20.50	6,560.0	6.10	546.56	320.0	7,426.56
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	320	26.50	8,480.0	6.10	546.56	320.0	9,346.56
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	320	No Bid	-		0.00	320.0	No Bid

	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
	8.60	2,752.0	70.90	6,352.6	9,104.6
	16.60	5,312.0	62.20	5,573.1	10,885.1
	15.95	5,104.0	55.20	4,945.9	10,049.9

CTH A (STH 78 to CTH G)

OPTION "A"

OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE

	Ton	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	1,360	20.50	27,880.0	0.00	0.00	1360.0	29,240.00
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	1,360	26.50	36,040.0	0.00	0.00	1360.0	37,400.00
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	1,360	No Bid	-		0.00	1360.0	No Bid

	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
	8.60	11,696.0	63.70	24,257.0	35,953.0
	16.60	22,576.0	54.90	20,905.9	43,481.9
	15.95	21,692.0	54.20	20,639.4	42,331.4

~~**Sigglekow Salt Shed (2831 STH 12/18, Cottage Grove)**~~

~~\$ 1.00 /ton Stockpile~~

~~0.28 Hauling/ton/mile~~

~~**CTH MN (Williams Drive to CTH N)**~~

~~**OPTION "A"**~~

~~**OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE**~~

	Ton	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
Rosenbaum, STH 198	190	No Bid	-		0.00	190.0	190.00
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	190	19.00	3,610.0		0.00	190.0	3,800.00
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	190	24.00	4,560.0		0.00	190.0	4,750.00
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	190	No Bid	-		0.00	190.0	190.00

	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
	14.00	2,690.0		0.0	2,690.0
	8.60	1,634.0		0.0	1,634.0
	16.60	3,154.0		0.0	3,154.0
	15.95	3,030.5		0.0	3,030.5

CTH V Salt Shed (1274 Greenway Road)

\$ 1.00 /ton Stockpile

0.28 Hauling/ton/mile

CTH TT (STH 19 to STH 73)

OPTION "A"

OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE

	Ton	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	710	13.00	9,230.0	4.80	954.24	710.0	10,894.24
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	710	20.30	14,413.0	4.80	954.24	710.0	16,077.24
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	710	No Bid	-		0.00	0.0	No Bid

	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
	8.60	6,106.0	23.70	4,711.6	10,817.6
	16.60	11,786.0	8.70	1,729.6	13,515.6
	15.95	11,324.5	43.80	8,707.4	20,031.9

CTH TV (STH 73 to STH 89)

OPTION "A"

OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE

	Ton	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	310	13.00	4,030.0	6.80	590.24	310.0	4,930.24
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	310	20.30	6,293.0	6.80	590.24	310.0	7,193.24
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	310	No Bid	-		0.00	0.0	No Bid

	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
	8.60	2,666.0	25.70	2,230.8	4,896.8
	16.60	5,146.0	4.70	408.0	5,554.0
	15.95	4,944.5	45.80	3,975.4	8,919.9

CTH V (USH 151 to STH 89)

OPTION "A"

OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE

	Ton	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	670	13.00	8,710.0	0.10	18.76	670.0	9,398.76
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	670	20.30	13,601.0	0.10	18.76	670.0	14,289.76
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	670	No Bid	-		0.00	0.0	No Bid

	\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
	8.60	5,762.0	22.30	4,183.5	9,945.5
	16.60	11,122.0	8.90	1,669.6	12,791.6
	15.95	10,686.5	38.90	7,297.6	17,984.1

2018 Sealcoat Bid Tally

Bid #118040 Agregate for Surface Treatment

Opened: March 30, 2018

CTH VV (USH 151 to CTH V)

	Ton
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	310
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	310
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	310

OPTION "A"

\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
13.00	4,030.0	2.30	199.64	310.0	4,539.64
20.30	6,293.0	2.30	199.64	310.0	6,802.64
No Bid	-		0.00	0.0	No Bid

OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE

\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
8.60	2,666.0	18.90	1,640.5	4,306.5
16.60	5,146.0	14.80	1,284.6	6,430.6
15.95	4,944.5	36.80	3,194.2	8,138.7

CTH Y Boat Landing (10007 County Road Y, Mazomanie)

\$ 1.00 /ton Stockpile

CTH Y (.37 miles north of Amenda Road to STH 78)

	Ton
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	710
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	710
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	710

OPTION "A"

\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
19.30	13,703.0	0.00	0.00	710.0	14,413.00
27.60	19,596.0	0.00	0.00	710.0	20,306.00
No Bid	-		0.00	0.0	No Bid

0.28 Hauling/ton/mile

OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE

\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
8.60	6,106.0	42.70	8,488.8	14,594.8
16.60	11,786.0	48.10	9,562.3	21,348.3
15.95	11,324.5	28.80	5,725.4	17,049.9

Mount Horeb Shop - 2737 State Road 78

\$ 1.00 /ton Stockpile

STH 92 (CTH G to Stonefield Way)

Vendor	Ton
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	1,060
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	1,060
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	1,060

OPTION "A"

\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
20.50	21,730.0	2.20	652.96	1060.0	23,442.96
26.50	28,090.0	2.20	652.96	1060.0	29,802.96
No Bid	-		0.00	0.0	No Bid

0.28 Hauling/ton/mile

OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE

\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
8.60	9,116.0	63.90	18,965.5	28,081.5
16.60	17,596.0	54.90	16,294.3	33,890.3
15.95	16,907.0	47.10	13,979.3	30,886.3

Stoughton Shop (2520 CTH B, Stoughton)

\$ 1.00 /ton Stockpile

STH 138 (STH 59 to US 51)

Vendor	Ton
Rosenbaum, STH 138	1,280
Michels Materials, Holder Pit, Rio	1,280
Michels Materials, Hubbleton, Waterloo	1,280
Kraemer Co, William, W11825 US 33	1,280

OPTION "A"

\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Stockpile	Total
No Bid	-		0.00	1280.0	No Bid
19.50	24,960.0	4.00	1,433.60	1280.0	27,673.60
24.50	31,360.0	4.00	1,433.60	1280.0	34,073.60
No Bid	-		0.00	1280.0	No Bid

0.28 Hauling/ton/mile

OPTION "B" SUPPLIERS STOCKPILE

\$/Ton	Material	Miles	Hauling	Total
11.00	14,080.0	0.00	0.0	14,080.0
8.60	11,008.0	44.50	15,948.8	26,956.8
16.60	21,248.0	27.90	9,999.4	31,247.4
15.95	20,416.0	48.80	17,489.9	37,905.9

PRICE PROPOSAL
CTH A (West County Line to STH 78)
 Town of Perry – Sections 17, 18 & 19

VENDOR NAME: Michels Materials

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

**OPTION "A" - Delivered to DNR Parking Lot at the Intersection of CTH G & CTH A
 Town of Primrose, NE ¼ Section 19**

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
1. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	320	20.50	6,560.00
2. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	320	26.50	8,480
3. Portage Boiler Slag	230		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
4. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	320	8.60	2,752.00
5. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	320	16.60	5,312.00
6. Portage Boiler Slag	230		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio & Waterloo
Address	

Does price include loading? Yes ___X___ No_____

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$_____ per ton

PRICE PROPOSAL
CTH A (STH 78 to CTH G)
 Town of Perry – Sections 16, 17, 22, 23, 24
 Town of Primrose – Section 19

VENDOR NAME: Michels Materials

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

**OPTION "A" - Delivered to DNR Parking Lot at the Intersection of CTH G & CTH A
 Town of Primrose, NE ¼ Section 19**

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
7. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	1,360	20.50	27,880.00
8. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	1,360	26.50	36,040.00
9. Portage Boiler Slag	1,000		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
10. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	1,360	8.60	11,696.00
11. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	1,360	16.60	22,576.00
12. Portage Boiler Slag	1,000		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

Does price include loading? Yes No

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$ _____ per ton

**PRICE PROPOSAL
 CTH MN (Williams Drive to CTH N)
 Town of Pleasant Springs – Section 4
 Town of Cottage Grove – Section 33**

VENDOR NAME: Michels Materials

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

OPTION "A" - Delivered to Siggleskow Salt Shed (2831 State Road 12/18, Cottage Grove) Town of Cottage Grove, Section 29

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
13. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	190	19.00	3,610.00
14. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	190	24.00	4,560.00
15. Portage Boiler Slag	140		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
16. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	190	8.60	1,634.00
17. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	190	16.60	3,154.00
18. Portage Boiler Slag	140		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

Does price include loading? Yes No

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$ _____ per ton

PRICE PROPOSAL
County Road TT (STH 19 to STH 73)
 Town of Medina - Sections 5 & 8
 Town of York – Sections 27, 28 & 33

VENDOR NAME: **Michels Materials**

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

**OPTION "A" - Delivered to CTH V Salt Facility (1274 Greenway Road, Marshall)
 Town of York, Section 4**

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
19. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	710	13.00	9,230.00
20. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	710	20.30	14,413.00
21. Portage Boiler Slag	520		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
22. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	710	8.60	6,106.00
23. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	710	16.60	11,786.00
24. Portage Boiler Slag	520		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

Does price include loading? Yes No

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$ _____ per ton

**PRICE PROPOSAL
CTH TV (STH 73 to STH 89)
Town of York – Sections 25, 26, 35 & 36**

VENDOR NAME: Michels Materials

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

**OPTION "A" - Delivered to CTH V Salt Facility (1274 Greenway Road, Marshall)
Town of York, Section 4**

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
25. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	310	13.00	4,030.00
26. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	310	20.30	6,293.00
27. Portage Boiler Slag	230		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holdings & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
28. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	310	8.60	2,666.00
29. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	310	16.60	5,146.00
30. Portage Boiler Slag	230		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holdings & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

Does price include loading? Yes No

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$ _____ per ton

PRICE PROPOSAL
CTH V (USH 151 to STH 89)
 Town of York – Sections 2,3,4 & 5

VENDOR NAME: Michels Materials

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

**OPTION "A" - Delivered to CTH V Salt Facility (1274 Greenway Road, Marshall)
 Town of York, Section 4**

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
31. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	670	13.00	8,710.00
32. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	670	20.30	13,601.00
33. Portage Boiler Slag	490		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
34. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	670	8.60	5,762.00
35. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	670	16.60	11,122.00
36. Portage Boiler Slag	490		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

Does price include loading? Yes ___X___ No _____

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$ _____ per ton

PRICE PROPOSAL
CTH Y (.37 miles north of Amenda Road to STH 78)
 Town of Mazomanie – Sections 22, 23, 24, 27, 28 & 33

VENDOR NAME: Michels Materials

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

OPTION "A" - Delivered to CTH Y Boat Landing (10007 CTH Y, Mazomanie)
 Town of Mazomanie, SW ¼ Section 23

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
37. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	1,700	19.30	32,810.00
38. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	1,700	27.60	46,920.00
39. Portage Boiler Slag	1,240		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
40. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	1,700	8.60	14,620.00
41. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	1,700	16.60	28,220.00
42. Portage Boiler Slag	1,240		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

Does price include loading? Yes ___X___ No ___

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$ _____ per ton

PRICE PROPOSAL
CTH VV (USH 151 to CTH V)
 Town of Bristol – Sections 11, 12, 13 & 14

VENDOR NAME: **Michels Materials**

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

**OPTION "A" - Delivered to CTH V Salt Facility (1274 Greenway Road, Marshall)
 Town of York, Section 4**

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
43. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	310	13.00	4,030.00
44. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	310	20.30	6,293.00
45. Portage Boiler Slag	220		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holdings & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
46. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	310	8.60	2,666.00
47. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	310	16.60	5,146.00
48. Portage Boiler Slag	220		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holdings & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

Does price include loading? Yes ___X___ No _____

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$ _____ per ton

PRICE PROPOSAL
STH 92 (CTH G to Stonefield Way)
 Town of Springdale – Sections 18, 19, 20, 28, 29,33 & 34

VENDOR NAME: Michels Materials

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

**OPTION "A" - Delivered to Mt Horeb Shop (2737 STH 78, Mt Horeb)
 Town of Blue Mounds, Section 11**

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
49. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	1,060	20.50	21,730.00
50. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	1,060	26.50	28,090.00
51. Portage Boiler Slag	780		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
52. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	1,060	8.60	9,116.00
53. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	1,060	16.60	17,596.00
54. Portage Boiler Slag	780		

PIT INFORMATION	
Pit Name	Holders & Waterloo
Location Town/Range/Section	Rio, Waterloo
Address	

Does price include loading? Yes No

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$ _____ per ton

**PRICE PROPOSAL
STH 138 (STH 59 to US 51)**

VENDOR NAME: Michels Materials

Pricing shall be inclusive of all labor, delivery costs and other expenses necessary to provide product in accordance with the specifications and terms and conditions of this bid document and your proposal.

**Project Location: STH 138 (STH 59 to US 51)
Town of Dunkirk, Dane County – Sections 7, 8, 17-20, 29-32
Town of Porter, Rock County**

**OPTION "A" - Delivered to Stoughton Shop (2520 CTH B, Stoughton)
Town of Pleasant Springs, Section 33**

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
55. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	1,280	19.50	24,960.00
56. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	1,280	24.50	31,360.00
57. Portage Boiler Slag	930		

Pit Name: Holders & Waterloo_____

Location (Town/Range/Section): Rio, Waterloo_____

(Address) _____

OPTION "B" – Supplier’s Stockpile

MATERIAL TYPE	QUANTITY (TONS)	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL BID
58. Pea Gravel, Grad. No. 3	1,280	8.60	10,836.00
59. Quartzite Chips, Grad. No. 3	1,280	16.60	21,248.00
60. Portage Boiler Slag	930		

Pit Name: Holders & Waterloo_____

Location (Town/Range/Section): Rio, Waterloo_____

(Address) _____

Does price include loading? Yes No

If no, loading cost, if provided is: \$ _____ per ton