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Dane County Contract Cover Sheet 

Dept./Division Human Services / HAA Contract # 
Admin will assign 

Vendor Name S and J Home Care, LLC dba BrightStar Care Addendum ☐ Yes ☒ No
Vendor MUNIS # 13511 Type of Contract 

Brief Contract 
Title/Description 

To provide on-site staffing at a COVID isolation 
shelter site, and on-call medical assessment for 
foster care placements 

☒ Dane County Contract 

☐ Grant 

☐ County Lessee 

☐ County Lessor 

Contract Term 4/13/2020 - 12/31/2020 
☐ Intergovernmental 

☐ Purchase of Property 

Total Contract 
Amount 

$ 250,000 
☐ Property Sale 

☐ Other 

Purchasing 
Authority 

☐ $11,000 or under – Best Judgment (1 quote required)

☐ Between $11,000 – $37,000 ($0 – $25,000 Public Works) (3 quotes required)

☐ Over $37,000 ($25,000 Public Works) (Formal RFB/RFP required) RFB/RFP # 

☐ Bid Waiver – $37,000 or under ($25,000 or under Public Works)

☒ Bid Waiver – Over $37,000 (N/A to Public Works)

☐ N/A – Grants, Leases, Intergovernmental, Property Purchase/Sale, Other

MUNIS Req. Org Code 39000 Obj Code 20025 Amount $ 250,000 
Req # 1461 Org Code Obj Code Amount $ 
Year 2020 Org Code Obj Code Amount $ 

Resolution 
/Addendum 

Form 

A resolution is required if the contract exceeds $100,000 ($40,000 Public Works).  
A copy of the Resolution must be attached to the contract cover sheet.  
☐ Contract does not exceed $100,000 ($40,000 Public Works) – a resolution is not required.

☒ Resolution required and a copy is attached. Res # 

☐ Addendum Form required. Year 2019 

Contract Review/Approvals 
Initials Dept. Date In Date Out Comments 

Received by DOA 

Controller 

Purchasing 

Corporation Counsel 

Risk Management 

County Executive 

Dane County Dept. Contact Info Vendor Contact Info 
Name Spring Larson, Contract Coord. Assistant Name Jeffrey Tews 

Phone # (608) 242-6391 Phone # 608-441-8620
Email larson.spring@countyofdane.com Email jtews@brightstarcare.com 

Address 1202 Northport Drive, RM Gr42A, Madison WI 53704 Address 3240 University Ave., Ste 3A, Madison WI  53705 
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a. Dane County Res. # N/A Approvals Initials Date

b. Budget/Personnel Required Yes g. Accountant DX 4/13/20

c. Program Manager Name Becker h. Supervisor CW 4/13/20

d. Current Contract Amount $250,000 i. Corporation Counsel

e. Adjustment Amount $      j. To Provider 4/14/2020 

f. Revised Contract Amount $      k. From Provider

BAF#_NA______ 
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Rev. 2/2020 

Certification:  
The attached contract is a: 

☐ Dane County Contract without any modifications. 

☒ 
Dane County Contract with modifications. 

The modifications have been reviewed by:      Dan Lowndes 
 

☐ Non-standard contract. 

Contract Cover Sheet Signature 

Dept. Head / 
Authorized 
Designee 

Signature Date 

  

Printed Name 

Shawn Tessmann, Director of Human Services 

Contracts Exceeding $100,000 
Major Contracts Review – DCO Sect. 25.11(3) 

Director of 
Administration 

Signature Date 

  

Comments 

 

Corporation 
Counsel 

Signature Date 

  

Comments 
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1

Goldade, Michelle

From: Hicklin, Charles
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 2:15 PM
To: Goldade, Michelle
Subject: Approve: Contract #13990
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Goldade, Michelle

From: Clow, Carolyn
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 2:15 PM
To: Goldade, Michelle
Subject: Approve: Contract #13990
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Goldade, Michelle

From: Lowndes, Daniel
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 2:15 PM
To: Goldade, Michelle
Subject: Approve: Contract #13990
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Goldade, Michelle

From: Gault, David
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 2:40 PM
To: Goldade, Michelle
Cc: Clow, Carolyn; Hicklin, Charles; Lowndes, Daniel; Stavn, Stephanie
Subject: Re: Contract #13990

Yes I approve. I’m on my phone and the vote button is not showing up  

 
Dave Gault  
Sent from my iPhone 
 
 

On Apr 14, 2020, at 2:36 PM, Goldade, Michelle <Goldade@countyofdane.com> wrote: 

  
Dave – not sure why the vote buttons aren’t showing up…maybe because you’re on your phone…if 
you’re okay with the contract, just approve by responding to this email saying that and I will move it 
forward for signature.  
  
Michelle 
  

From: Clow, Carolyn <clow.carolyn@countyofdane.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 2:31 PM 
To: Gault, David <Gault@countyofdane.com>; Goldade, Michelle <Goldade@countyofdane.com> 
Cc: Hicklin, Charles <Hicklin@countyofdane.com>; Lowndes, Daniel <Lowndes@countyofdane.com>; 
Stavn, Stephanie <Stavn@countyofdane.com> 
Subject: RE: Contract #13990 
  
This contract is completely standard, with two exceptions: 

1) Removal of environmental liability insurance 
2) Addition of professional liability insurance 

  
Dan Lowndes reviewed this twice prior to sending it to the vendor for final signature. 
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From: Gault, David <Gault@countyofdane.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 2:30 PM 
To: Goldade, Michelle <Goldade@countyofdane.com> 
Cc: Hicklin, Charles <Hicklin@countyofdane.com>; Clow, Carolyn <clow.carolyn@countyofdane.com>; 
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